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A ccreditation is used in many fields, including 
education, travel, construction, and health 
care. When implemented correctly, it improves 

quality, performance, and safety, while signaling to 

the public that an accredited entity 
is committed to an agreed-on set 
of values. Key to its effectiveness 
is broad acceptance of the stan-
dards on which it’s based and a 
robust process for ensuring that 
accredited entities conform to them.

In clinical medical research, 
high-performing research sites are 
essential for the effective and ef-
ficient conduct of trials, but cur-
rently only a fraction of active sites 
would qualify as high-performing. 
There are a variety of potential so-
lutions, including greater profes-
sionalism and voluntary accredi-
tation.

Citing the many challenges fac-
ing the clinical trials endeavor and 
recognizing the lack of a reliable 
framework and method for assess-
ing and ensuring research quality, 
Johnston et al. recently called for 
voluntary accreditation of clinical 

research sites to accelerate the dis-
semination of standards and pro-
cesses and to accelerate develop-
ment of therapeutic products.1 Can 
the various players in the biomedi-
cal research-and-development eco-
system come together to imple-
ment accreditation that will be 
embraced by everyone involved as 
responsive to concerns about the 
operations and quality of research 
sites?

We submit that the answer is 
yes. In fact, approximately 6 years 
ago, an initiative to design a sys-
tem of site accreditation was begun 
as part of a larger collaboration 
that aims to transform the clinical 
research process through the ap-
plication of systems thinking — 
that is, seeing this complex endeav-
or as integrated sets of components 
(people, processes, and technolo-
gies) that are connected and inter

operable, working together as a 
whole to achieve synergy.2 Implicit 
in this initiative’s conception was 
an understanding that an accredi-
tation system must recognize and 
reward a site’s commitment to 
high quality and performance and 
that sites and trial sponsors would 
have to be compensated somehow 
for the burden of achieving such 
accreditation. Today, this initiative 
is coming to fruition, and we be-
lieve that it will soon provide the 
essential elements of an effective 
program for accreditation of clini-
cal research sites.

The initiative followed a con-
sensus approach (see box).3 The 
first step was a broad-based survey 
of relevant parties to elicit their at-
titudes and opinions regarding the 
characteristics of high-performing 
research sites, the sorts of stan-
dards whose application could en-
gender those characteristics, and 
the challenges involved in adopt-
ing both standards and accredi-
tation processes.4 These insights 
provided the basis for a multiyear 
effort to create standards that 
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would benefit clinical trial partic-
ipants, competent authorities, in-
stitutional review boards, and the 
public.

Next came development of an 
overarching initial set of standards 
focused on overall quality manage-
ment. Diverse working groups con-
vened by the nonprofit Alliance for 
Clinical Research Excellence and 
Safety (ACRES) have worked over 
the past 2 years in conjunction 
with the British Standards Institu-
tion to develop such a set of stan-
dards. We initially focused on 
quality management, with the aim 
of protecting the rights and well-
being of research participants and 
facilitating clinical trial results that 
are verifiable, valued, and valuable. 
This effort has been grounded in 
a conviction that quality is an es-
sential element of any process-
improvement initiative, including 
accreditation.

These quality standards are now 
being made available by request to 
qualified individuals and organiza-
tions for review and comment as 
part of an ongoing consultation, 
development, and validation pro-
cess (https:/​/​standardsdevelopment 
​.bsigroup​.com/​Projects/​9018-01652).5 

They incorporate some well-estab-
lished and generally accepted stan-
dards and applicable guidelines, 
such as those issued by the Inter-
national Organization for Stan-
dardization (ISO) and the Interna-
tional Council for Harmonization 
(ICH). And they provide a foun-
dation on which more specific 
standards will be developed for 
multiple domains (e.g., facilities, 
personnel, information technology, 
management and administration, 
and patient engagement). These 
domain-focused standards will be 
incorporated in future years, as 
the accreditation process evolves. 
Certain specialized standards are 
also planned for areas such as pe-
diatric trials, first-in-human stud-
ies, and studies in cognitively im-
paired people.

Standards alone cannot be ef-
fective without a robust accredita-
tion process. As currently envi-
sioned, a process that progresses 
from commitment to achieving 
accreditation, to assessment of per-
formance and quality, through 
qualification for and maintenance 
of accreditation will permit a 
staged implementation that can 
accommodate the wide variation 

in readiness among existing sites, 
without imposing an undue bur-
den on individual sites. The stan-
dards developers recognize that 
such flexibility is essential to the 
effectiveness of the process. Fur-
thermore, the process itself must 
not create a barrier to participa-
tion, but rather must constitute a 
program with incentives for pro-
gressive improvement through 
which sites can demonstrate and 
be rewarded for their commitment 
to excellence in performance.

In their call to action, Johnston 
et al. speak to the need for stan-
dards that will promote both qual-
ity and efficiency, but they focus 
on metrics.1 Metrics are necessary 
for assessing performance and 
quality, but like guidelines and 
standard operating procedures, 
they should not be confused with 
formal standards. Although typi-
cal “standards” language, such as 
that in the ICH Good Clinical 
Practice Guidelines, often clearly 
indicates what must be done, it 
generally does not clarify the ra-
tionale in a way that ignites and 
maintains a workforce’s motiva-
tion, nor does it outline the pro-
cess whereby required competen-
cies can be developed or improved.

Similarly, since there have pre-
viously been no true standards for 
clinical research sites, calls for 
“harmonization of standards”3 
could result in an overemphasis 
on performance metrics and mea-
sures of compliance. An emphasis 
on creating a culture of compe-
tence and conscience that produc-
es compliance and responsible 
performance relevant to trial re-
quirements and patients’ needs 
is more in the spirit of true stan-
dards and robust accreditation. 
The effort to develop global ac-
creditation for clinical research 
sites brings together representa-
tives of the various parties engaged 

Independence
Maintain standard development as an independent activity
Collaborate, harmonize, and integrate to avoid duplication
Establish a management team
Use standards experts for writing

Transparency
Disclose and manage potential conflicts of interest
Publish methods and publicize ways in which to participate in the development  

of standards
Create an open process for stakeholders and the public to review draft standards

Effectiveness
Organize separate domain work groups

Stakeholders nominate small group of experts to draft standards
Standards are based on public comments from stakeholders

Use a common template to describe standards
Work virtually to expand participation
Develop methods to assess the value of standards to the research ecosystem

*Adapted from Johnston et al.3

Principles for Developing Standards.*
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in the research enterprise and har-
nesses their expertise and invest-
ments to collaboratively respond 
to this challenge so that all the 
relevant needs are addressed.

The question of who will do the 
accrediting remains under consid-
eration. Since the accreditation 
process must be objective and free 
from potentially conflicting fi-
nancial interests, we envision the 
creation of an independent entity 
to house and maintain the stan-
dards. The accrediting bodies will 
probably include nonprofit public-
interest organizations, for-profit 
organizations, and government 
agencies (depending on the prevail-
ing norms in individual countries), 
but each organization should be 
approved by the independent en-
tity to ensure fair and consistent 
interpretation and application of 
the standards globally.

Experience with existing accred-
itation programs calls into ques-
tion the viability and practicality 
of relying solely on site visits for 
assessing suitability for accredi-
tation. Instead, a combination of 
guided self-appraisals leveraged by 
judiciously conducted on-site as-
sessments and the liberal use of 
user-friendly supporting technol-
ogies (such as video conferencing, 

electronic clinical trial manage-
ment systems, and distributed net-
work collaboration platforms) by 
site personnel will be essential. 
Equally challenging to traditional 
accreditation models is the sober-
ing reality that more than 100,000 
research sites globally will prob-
ably have to be accredited (and yet 
more are emerging in response 
to the evolution of personalized 
and precision medicine). Accom-
modating all these sites involves 
substantial logistic challenges 
that cannot be overcome without 
innovative approaches. The most 
important of these is deployment 
of technology for information ex-
change and validation by trial 
sponsors, contract research orga-
nizations, patients, regulators, and 
researchers to achieve a technol-
ogy-assisted dynamic accredita-
tion process.

Key to implementation of site 
accreditation will be acceptance 
and recognition of its value by all 
these players. As we continue to 
develop the accreditation process, 
including addressing important fi-
nancial considerations and im-
plementation methods, we recog-
nize that the process must be 
practical and sustainable and that 
perspectives from all stakeholder 

groups are essential. With the ini-
tial global quality standards now 
available, a pilot implementation 
program is slated to begin in early 
2019. We believe this effort is long 
overdue, but it’s not too late to 
move it forward.

Disclosure forms provided by the au-
thors are available at NEJM.org.

From the Alliance for Clinical Research Ex-
cellence and Safety, Cambridge, MA. 

This article was published on June 27, 2018, 
at NEJM.org.
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